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Preface

‘‘Who Is Kermit and Why Is He in My Computer?’’ asked a (now not so) recent headline
1[60]. Kermit is not a ‘‘he’’ at all, but rather an inanimate, genderless, yet friendly com-

puter software package that lets just about any two computers in the world communicate
effectively with each other, no matter how they may differ in size, age, appearance, loca-
tion, power, architecture, manufacture, or nationality.

This book describes C-Kermit, quite possibly the world’s most portable communications
software program, for UNIX computer systems (hundreds of different ones); Digital
Equipment Corporation (Open)VMS on both VAX and Alpha; PCs with Windows 95,
Windows NT, or OS/2; Data General AOS/VS, Stratus VOS, the Commodore Amiga, the
Atari ST, and computers with the QNX and OS-9 realtime operating systems.  The UNIX
version of C-Kermit runs on all known implementations of UNIX (see page 16) and on
computers ranging from PCs to large mainframes and supercomputers.

C-Kermit software offers you terminal connection, error-free file transfer and manage-
ment, script programming, and comprehensive support for national and international
character sets, over a wide variety of communication methods including direct and dialed
serial connections and (in most versions) TCP/IP, X.25, or other networks.  C-Kermit’s
full-featured script programming language operates consistently across all of C-Kermit’s
platforms and over all types of connections.  It allows routine, complex, or time-consum-
ing communications tasks to be executed for you automatically.

1Numbers in brackets refer to entries in the References on page 595.
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C-Kermit transfers text and binary files faithfully and efficiently with any other kind of
computer. The Kermit file transfer protocol takes care of synchronization, error detection
and correction, file format and character set conversion, and myriad details you should
never have to worry about.  It was designed to work in even the most hostile communica-
tion environments, where other protocols fail.  C-Kermit’s Kermit implementation, along
with that of MS-DOS Kermit, with which it was codeveloped, is the premiere and defini-
tive rendition of the Kermit protocol.

The Kermit file transfer protocol was originally designed in 1981 by Frank da Cruz and
Bill Catchings at Columbia University, which has been ‘‘Kermit headquarters’’ ever since,
and extended over the years by the authors and others — principally Joe Doupnik of Utah
State University and John Chandler of the Harvard / Smithsonian Astronomical Obser-
vatory — to meet the evolving needs of the people who depend on it.  Because the Kermit
protocol is well documented [21], easy to implement, robust, extensible, and adaptable to
almost any style of communication and any computer architecture, it has long since taken
its place as a worldwide de facto standard for reliable data transfer.
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an online file that accompanies the C-Kermit software.  The name of the file depends on
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